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Authorities' responses to the situation. 

With lending growth converging to more sustainable levels and the economic activity slowing 
down over first two quarters of 2008, the inflationary pressures have started to ease. The 
fading inflationary pressures and the forecasts showing further decline in inflation allowed the 
Bank of Latvia to continue the gradual unwinding of the tight monetary policy conditions, 
which were in place since 2005. The Bank of Latvia has reduced the reserve ratio for bank 
liabilities wit!J agreed maturity over two years by 1 percentage point to 5% and for other 
liabilities by 1 percentage point to 7%, while the reserve ratio for repo transactions remained 
0%. These changes took effect from 24 October 2008. 

Interest rates of the Bank of Latvia remain unchanged since 24 February 2008, and are as 
follows: 
- refinancing - 6.0%;
- overnight deposit facility- 3.0%;
- overnight lending facility- 7.5%.

Additionally, the Bank of Latvia provides extra liquidity against eligible collateral in volumes 
which are compatible with the de facto currency board regime. We try to avoid a situation 
where monetary base is not covered by 100% of foreign reserves. 

The Latvian government has also taken several measures with an aim to stabilize the situation. 
Namely, on 13 October the government agreed to increase the guaranteed limit for all 
depositors up to EUR 50,000 with no limit of duration of applicability. The government is 
currently working on the balanced state budget of 2009. To achieve this target, the 
government is determined to freeze the wage bill of public sector employees, to cut budget 
expenses even further and implement structural reforms to optimise the expenses side of the 
budget. 

To sum up, the Bank of Latvia considers the situation as being very serious, in particular, for 
the domestically owned banks, and demanding decisive measures. However, as the lats is 
pegged to the euro, the central bank is not in a position to provide additional liquidity in the 
domestic currency to cover short term liquidity constrains. Euro-denominated short term 
liquidity provided to the domestic banks would be the best solution for the de facto currency 
board regime as it is in Latvia. 

In the clear signs of domestic market disfunction, the Bank of Latvia asks for immediate 
assistance from the ECB. The Bank of Latvia would be ready to accept terms and conditions 
of aid similar to those announced in the ECB EUR 5 billion repurchase transaction agreement 
with the National Bank of Hungary. The Bank of Latvia asks for a EUR 1 billion facility. 
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